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50pc rise 
in number 
of AIDS 
victims 
The number of cases of AIDS 

reported to Britain Jumped by 
58 per cent, from 16 to 24. in 
September, the Public flesith 
Laboratory report In the Bra 
fish Medical Journal. 

Thera were three deaths smug 
the eight mew cases, theagh 
only one of the five bomosex. 
W men Wailed did. The 
other two deaths were of e 
men 
blood~d 

 edug f
iseasee, ~hiemo hi~W, 

who, according to some 
reports, was given blood-clot-
ting agent contaminated by 
that from an AIDS-Infected 
American donor, and a 
woman said to have had a 
number of sexual psrta0es, 

Four of the five bomesaxual 
men among the September 
cases had had serial eamtmet 
with United States arthials, 
the other with a Caribbean 
national, says the report- The 
laboratory are examining 
several other suspected cases. 

AIDS -- Acquired Immune 
Deficiency Syndrome -- Is 
the breakdown of the Ibody's 
natural disease-fighting 
system. 

It has been linked with home-
sexuality and drag Injecting 
in the US, where It first 
appeared in 3980. Bet a 
number of women have also 
been affected, including a 
non who left her order to 
work among prostitutes in the 
Caribbean. 

The disease, which ban sew 
claimed ten deaths in the UK, 
is believed to have been 
brought to Britain by homo-
sexual men returning from 
holiday in the US sad the 
Caribbean. 
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