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WRJTTEN STATEMENT OF KEVAN WALKER ON BEHALF 0F KING’S
‘ COLLEGE HOSPITAL NHS FOUMDATION TRUST

‘ ‘! prowde thss statement in response to two requests under Ruie 9 of the lnqunry o
: fRuies 2006 dated 20 May 2022 and 7 June 2022

‘ l,:Kévarﬁ Wa!kér; ‘Head of Pa’giént Regdrd :Seh.rices, will say as follows: -

: ‘_'Regtigéstfforinformatién—FOI 8096

‘ :lt has come to our attem;on that a f:re affected the rec:ord—keepmg at ngs k &
e College Hospttal in the late 19805 or early 19903 To venfy the above the : S
Inquny requests mformatton w;th regards to the foi!owmg questlons S

1 Was there a ﬁre, or any ather event at ng s Coliege» Hosp:tal whtch caused ‘ S
the destruct;on of records at some stage in the late 1 9805/early 1 99057

= I so, please prowde details of

- a the nature of the mctdent(s), and xdentlf‘ ed cause(s) of the mcldenﬂs o

g ‘b the tlme and date{s) when the mc:dent(s) occurred : S :

e the extent of the damage to med:cal records (t.e percentage of: S
: irecards damaged/destroyed) : : |
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1. This information is not held.

2. Detail of all searches. The following departments were asked if they held
any records of such an incident or any incident which caused the
destruction of records in the given time frame - Legal, Estates, Patient
records:

i. Head of Patient Records (KW) - | can confirm that | have searched all
areas of Patient Records Departments across all sites for any
documentary evidence that reports on a fire, but regret | have not been
able to find anything. None of the staff currently employed in Patient
Records had been employed in the 1980s, and therefore | am not able
to provide any statement on the event.

ii. Associate Director, Estates - Capital, Estates & Facilities Directorate
(MW): No records found.

ii. Legal: Referred us to the above.

2. Please provide any documentation in relation to the incident and give details

of the records that were damaged/destroyed (where that exists);

3. This information is not held.

4, Detail of all searches: please see above.

3. Were there any archives which backed-up the records which were

subsequently destroyed? If so, where are these held?

5. This information is not held. Paper Records have always been stored and
retained in accordance with the relevant NHS Code of Practice, however it
is not known what service or facilities supported this prior to 2010 when

archived records started to be moved to a contracted off-site service.

4. Were there any applicable policies or guidelines that recommended or

discussed how an incident of this nature should be dealt with?
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6. This information is not held. Prior to 1994 the legislation pertaining to
retention is not known, however from 1994 — to date, guidance has been
managed by the NHS Code of Practice in various releases up to the
current NHSX CoP 2021.

If so:
a. Please provide us with the relevant policies or guidelines that were

applicable at the time of the incident/s.

7. This information is not held. Policies prior to October 2012 cannot be
identified. However, please note that Trust policy is led by and mirrors the
NHS Code of Practice. You can search NHS Digital (now known as NHS
X) search engine Home - NHS Digital which may contain guidance for

previous years.

b. Did relevant policies/quidelines stipulate that a record of incidents
causing damage/destruction to medical records should be kept? If so,

was this followed by your Trust?

8. This information is not held — see above.

c. How often were the relevant policies/quidelines reviewed and who

was responsible for reviewing and updating these policies/guidelines?

9. The guidance would have been reviewed as required to meet changes to
current legislation or national standard. Since 1994 there have been 7

updates made to the current guidance.
d. Were the policies/quidelines governing storage of medical records
subject to review following any incidents so as to prevent any

recurrences?

10.  This information is not held. However, there has always been an

overarching principle that records must be stored in such a way that they
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are accessible and safeguarded against environmental damage. A typical
paper document may be stored in a filing cabinet in an office. However,
some organisations employ file rooms with specialized environmental
controls including temperature and humidity. Vital records may need to be
stored in a disaster-resistant safe or vault to protect against fire, flood,

earthquakes and conflict.

5. Following the destruction of records, have any policies or guidelines that
recommended or discussed specifically how to prevent an incident of this
nature in the future been put in place? If so, please provide us with the
relevant policies or guidelines that were established after the incident/s

occurred.

11.  This information is not held, but please see above.

Request for information — FOI 8121

6. What policies, if any, relating to the destruction or retention of medical
records did King’s College Hospital NHS Foundation Trust, or the individual
hospitals that now make up the Trust, have in place during the time period

1980 - present? If possible, please supply copies of any such policies.

12. Please see the attached documents (WITN7211002; WITN7211003;
WITN7211004). These documents have been redacted to remove
information not requested and/or personal information that, under the Data
Protection Act and hence Section 40 of the Freedom of Information Act
2000, should not be disclosed.

13. Please note that policies prior to October 2012 cannot be identified.
However, please note that Trust policy is led by and mirrors the NHS Code
of Practice. You can search NHS Digital (now known as NHS X) search
engine Home - NHS Digital which may contain guidance for previous

years.
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7. anch department(s)/team(s) held respons:blkty for the destmctzon or : -
: retentmn of medtcai records dunng th:s t;me penod’? o &

| :14; | Patienf records.

8. In relat:on to changes, updates and tmpmvements of the Trust’s pohctes‘ o

ireiatmg to the destruct:on and retentmn of medtcal records over the t:me: |

S i penod please explam to the best of your knowledge what these were dnven_f =
- by, for example any Govemment gwdance prowded :

“15{ ;‘ Gu dance has been algned to the NHS Code of Practtce in vanous\
- refeases up to the current NHSX CoP 2021

emeﬁt‘ofrr h .

| be‘!ieve_ that the facts stated in this w‘itness‘istétemeht‘ éte trUe.;j‘ . -

o i GRO-C
& Slgned

H:éﬂDated W& meurﬁfz:‘/ 202?’
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